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Picking the Right CRM for Your Sales Team

 

This article provides a guide to selecting the optimal Customer Relationship Management
(CRM) system for your sales team. It outlines key considerations, features to look for, and a
step-by-step approach to ensure you choose a CRM that aligns with your business needs and
empowers your sales team to succeed.

PS: Are you a Nigerian resident abroad and you need to send money to your loved ones back
home ? The stress is over now! Send money to Nigeria using the MonieWorld app. It's fast,
easy and has great rates! MonieWorld is powered by Moniepoint. Sign up with my link
https://spoo.me/iy8taz

Understanding Your Needs

Before diving into the vast CRM marketplace, it’s crucial to understand your specific
requirements. This involves assessing your current sales processes, identifying pain points,
and defining your goals for implementing a CRM.

#1 Analyse Your Current Sales Process

Before you can really boost your sales process, you need to understand where you are
coming from. You need to analyse your current sales process in order to see areas that need
adjustment. You need to map your sales cycle. Understand the different sales processes and
know the stages that your prospects have to go through when they want to buy your
products and services.

 

You need to document each stage, from lead generation to closing the deal. It’s very
important. 
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Also, you need to identify bottlenecks surrounding your sales process. You also need to
pinpoint areas where your team struggles, such as lead qualification, follow-up, or reporting. 

Besides, you need to understand data flow for your sales process: You need to ask questions
such as: How is customer information currently collected, stored, and shared?

#2 Define Your Goals

Before you start the entire sales process or choose the right CRM tool for your business, you
need to understand what you want to achieve with CRM. You can set goals such as increasing
sales, improving customer retention, and enhancing team collaboration, among others. It is
your goals that will determine what type of tools you are going to go for. 

 

You also need to set measurable objectives. You must know what you want. I might decide
that I want to increase the lead conversion rate by 15% within six months.

 

After you have set the goals for your CRM initiative, you need to prioritise your needs. You
also have to determine which features are essential versus “nice-to-have.” This will help you
determine what needs to be achieved first and what you can decide to achieve later. 
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#3 Consider Your Team’s Size and Structure:

Before you choose a CRM solution, try to decide on how many users will use the Platform.

Also, it is not all your users who need access to the CRM System.

It might be that it is only your Front Desk staff who will have access to the Platform. How
many users will need access to the CRM? Knowing the number of users will also help us to
determine which of the solutions we should go for. 

 

What are the different roles and responsibilities within your sales team? When you
understand the roles, you will know what you need to put in place in order for your teams to
deliver. 

You also need to understand the composition of your team. You have to understand the
number of your available team members. This will allow you to understand the type of CRM
System that you need as well as other features that you need to put in place. Please ask
questions such as: Do you need to support remote or mobile sales teams?

Key CRM Features to Consider

Once you have a clear understanding of your needs, you can start evaluating CRM systems
based on their features. Here are some essential features to look for:

#1 Contact Management

You need a centralised database to store all customer information in one place, including
contact details, communication history, and purchase records. This will help you to have a
single unified view of your customers.

PEOPLE ALSO READ:  The Dimensions Of Customer Relationships: Understanding The
Perspectives
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There is a need for you to also segment your users. All your group contacts should be based
on group contacts. It should also be based on demographics, industry, or other criteria for
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targeted marketing campaigns.

There should also be a deliberate effort towards data enhancement. You need to
automatically update contact information from external sources.

#2  Lead Management:

There should also be a deliberate effort towards lead generation. You should work on lead
capture. You have to integrate with your website and marketing automation tools to capture
leads automatically.

You also need to work on lead scoring. You must prioritise leads based on their likelihood to
convert. You have to have some criteria that you will use to judge every lead coming to your
sales funnel. This will determine the level of attention that you will give to each of your leads.

 

Lead nurturing is another angle that you need to work on. You will need to automate follow-
up emails and other communications to move leads through the sales funnel. You also make
sure that you are providing relevant content that will move your prospective customers from
prospects to brand advertisers. 

 

#3 Sales Automation

There is a need to develop workflow automation for the CRM System. You have to automate
repetitive tasks, such as sending follow-up emails or creating tasks. Automating such a
process will allow you to have time to perform other tasks. 

You can also automate Sales forecasting to close more sales. You will have to be able to
predict future sales based on historical data and the current pipeline.

Another aspect is Opportunity management, where you will have to track deals through each
stage of the sales cycle. This will help you to identify mistakes that are causing you to lose
profitable prospects and customers. 
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#4 Reporting and Analytics:

As part of the efforts to report all the activities going on with your CRM efforts. You need to
come up with customizable dashboards. You need to visualise key sales metrics, such as
sales revenue, conversion rates, and pipeline value.

You must be able to generate your Sales reports. The reports should generate reports on
sales performance, lead generation, and other important metrics that will allow you to make
sales decisions. 

Your reports should also gives room for Data analysis. You must be able to identify trends
and patterns to improve sales strategies. This will ensure that you are not making the same
mistakes over and over again.

 

#5 Integration Capabilities:

Most times, if you need to grow, you need to leverage integrations. One of such is email
integration. You need to integrate your blog with your Email Service provider. This will allow
you to send newsletters, email updates and more. You can connect your blog with email
platforms such as Gmail, Outlook to track email communications.

Calendar integration: Sync your calendar with the CRM to schedule appointments and
meetings.

Marketing automation integration: Connect with your marketing automation platform to align
sales and marketing efforts.

Other integrations: Integrate with other business applications, such as accounting software or
customer support tools.

#6  Mobile Accessibility:

When you look at the global internet usage, you will observe that most people access the
internet from mobile phones. That is why you need to implement Mobile CRM. You have to
leverage on Mobile app. This will allow your sales team to access the CRM from your
smartphone or tablet.
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Offline access: You also need to put offline access into consideration. Your team must be able
to view and update data even when you’re not connected to the internet. This is necessary
because your Team might have to work in remote areas at times. 

There is a need to choose a CRM System that has Mobile notifications. You must be able to
receive alerts for new leads, tasks, or opportunities. This will ensure that no opportunity is
lost because of the inefficiency of the CRM System. 

PEOPLE ALSO READ:  Internet Influence On CRM: Tricks On How To Get More Customers
Online
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#7 User-Friendliness:

No matter how good you are as a customer-centric organisation, you will be losing a lot of
customers if your website or your app is not mobile-friendly. You need to have an Intuitive
interface. The App should be easy to navigate and use, even for non-technical users. They
should be easy to use without any aid. 

 

You also need to have an app that has a customizable interface. You have to tailor the CRM
to your specific needs and preferences. The customers should be able to change the look and
feel of the app in order to get the best out of the app. 

 

There should be provision for Training and support. Your Sales Team need to have access to
training materials and responsive customer support. They should be able to learn on the job
as well. 

Evaluating CRM Options

Once you know what features you need, you can start evaluating different CRM systems.
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Here’s a step-by-step approach:

#1 Research CRM Vendors:

Before you choose any CRM solution, you have to be sure you have done your homework.
You need to read Online reviews about the CRM tools of your choice. You can read reviews on
sites like G2 Crowd, Capterra, and TrustRadius, among others.

You can also visit vendor websites to see what they have to offer. You must explore vendor
websites to learn about their features, pricing, and customer testimonials. Be diligent enough
to read the negative reviews as well.

You also need to keep yourself abreast of Industry reports. Try to consult industry reports and
analyst reviews to get an objective assessment of different CRM systems.

#2 Request Demos

Also, you have to schedule demos with several vendors. This will definitely allow you to see
the CRM in action and ask questions. You can also include your team in the demonstration
process so that they can also ask questions. You must also ensure that you get the reactions
and feedback of your sales team before you make the final purchasing decisions.

 

Before you schedule the demo session, you must have prepared a list of questions that you
would like to ask their sales team. In asking those questions, you need to prepare a list of
specifics that will allow you to understand the nitty-gritty of such CRM systems. 

 

#3 Consider Pricing and Licensing:

When you are trying to use any CRM System, you need to clearly understand their pricing
model. Please how much you have pay as well as how many users are accommodated per
account. Some CRMs charge per user per month, while others offer tiered pricing plans.

You also need to know the implementation costs for the system. Please consider the cost of



data migration, customization, and training for your staffs and other Sales team that will be
using the system. 

Try to evaluate the long-term cost of ownership of such system. Don’t just focus on the initial
price; consider the ongoing costs of maintenance and support. You will not want to
implement a system that you will later abandon along the line. 

 

#4 Conduct a Pilot Progra

There is a need for you to test the CRM System and make sure that it works perfectly within
small groups before it is being introduced to a large number of users. Select a small group of
users. These small groups must consist of your Sales team and those that will actually be
using the product or service.

 

There is a need for you to also Implement the CRM on a limited scale: This will allow you to
test and discover some of the larger problem that you are likely to face when the system is
being introduced on a large scale.

 

You also need to gather feedback from users. You should Identify any issues or areas for
improvement. This will allow you to ultimately correct errors and adopt systems that will work
for the entire organization eventually. 

PEOPLE ALSO READ:  CX Value Realization: Maximizing Returns on Customer Experience
Investments

Powered by Inline Related Posts

 

#5 Make Your Decision

After you might have tested the system and consider the feedbacks, you need to weigh the
pros and cons of each CRM system. You have to consider your needs, budget, and team’s
preferences.
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make sure you choose the CRM that best aligns with your business goals. You choose not just
choose the cheapest option, make sure you choose the one that will deliver the most value.

Implementation and Training

Once you’ve chosen a CRM System, it’s important to implement it properly and provide
adequate training to your sales team.

#1  Data Migration

The first thing you need to do is to clean and prepare your data for migration. You have to
remove duplicates and ensure data is accurate and consistent as well. 

You also need to migrate your data to the CRM System. When doing this , you need to use a
data migration tool or work with a CRM consultant in order to have a successful migration.

 

Moreso, you have to verify the accuracy of your data: Ensure that all data has been migrated
correctly. You will want to avoid the story that touched. 

 

#2 Customisation:

After you might have successfully migrated your data, you will need to customise the CRM to
your specific needs: Configure fields, workflows, and reports among others to your own
taste. 

You also have to integrate the CRM with other business applications: Connect with your email
provider, calendar, and marketing automation platform.

You must also test your customisations thoroughly: Ensure that everything is working as
expected.



 

#3 Training:

You need to provide comprehensive training to your sales team in order for them to deliver.
You need to teach them how to use the CRM effectively.

You also need to offer ongoing support to your team. You must be ready to provide answer
questions and assist as needed. At times , you can sign extended support and agreement
contract with the Consultant to the system going. 

You also have to encourage adoption of the CRM System. You have to make sure your sales
team is using the CRM consistently.

Conclusion

Choosing the right CRM for your sales team is a critical decision that can have a significant
impact on your business. By carefully considering your needs, evaluating different CRM
options, and implementing the CRM properly, you can empower your sales team to close
more deals, improve customer relationships, and drive revenue growth.

 

Remember to involve your sales team in the selection process and provide them with the
training and support they need to succeed.

 

Action Point

Get My 66 Page eBook on How to Run Success Ads ON TikTok for 2,000 Naira. Click
Here to Buy.

 

Get my 90 Page ebook on How to Run Ads on Facebook. Click here to buy now.
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PS: Are you a Nigerian resident abroad and you need to send money to your loved ones back
home? The stress is over now! Send money to Nigeria using the MonieWorld app. It’s fast,
easy and has great rates! MonieWorld is powered by Moniepoint. Sign up with my link
 
 
https://spoo.me/iy8taz

 

P.S.: If you need private online training on any of the ICT courses I offer here and you are in
Nigeria, please send me a DM on my WhatsApp at +2348103180831. Please note that the
Training will be 100percent online. It will be delivered via Zoom or Google Meet.

PS: I know you might agree with some of the points raised in this article or disagree with
some of the issues raised.

 

Please share your thoughts on the topic discussed. We would appreciate it if you could drop
your comment. Thanks in anticipation.
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